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Earlier this month, the British Columbia Ministry of Environment and Climate Change 
Strategy posted a discussion paper titled “Making Contaminated Sites Climate Ready.” 
The discussion paper, which is available for public comment until Nov. 30, 2022, 
summarizes the ministry's policy proposals to incorporate climate change adaptation 
and sustainability into the BC contaminated sites framework. These proposals are part 
of a larger trend of recent amendments to the Environmental Management Act and the 
Contaminated Sites Regulation, and forthcoming changes to the process for soil 
relocation.

Below are some key takeaways from the discussion paper:

 Possible policy changes that will increase reporting and evaluation requirements 
for people carrying out remediation of contaminated sites;

 Proposed additional requirements for engagement and consultation with 
Indigenous communities with respect to contaminated sites;

 Proposed requirements to consider the impacts of future climate change and 
extreme weather events as part of remediation plans; and

 Possible requirements for physical remediation of viable drinking water aquifers 
where practicable, which would be a significant departure from the current 
requirements that permit risk-based approaches to manage aquifers.

The ministry will publish a report summarizing the feedback in spring 2023. Any 
legislative changes will be available as early as spring 2024. BLG can assist clients 
wanting to comment on the discussion paper and monitor these developments.

Outcomes proposed in the discussion paper

The discussion paper outlines six proposed outcomes to incorporate climate change 
adaption and sustainability into British Columbia's contaminated sites framework and 
address remediation requirements to protect groundwater quality. If implemented, these 
proposed outcomes could bring significant changes to how contaminated sites in British 
Columbia are managed.

https://engage.gov.bc.ca/app/uploads/sites/121/2022/09/2022-09-20-FINAL-TO-POST-Making-Contaminated-Sites-Climate-Ready-Discussion-Paper.pdf
https://www2.gov.bc.ca/gov/content/environment/air-land-water/site-remediation/legislation-and-protocols
https://www.blg.com/en/insights/2021/02/amendments-to-the-british-columbia-contaminated-sites-regime
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Outcome 1: Incorporate engagement with Indigenous peoples as a component of 
remediation plans. In November 2019, the Province of British Columbia passed the 
Declaration on the Rights of Indigenous Peoples Act. The provincial government has an 
obligation under this Act to align laws with the United Nations Declaration on the Rights 
of Indigenous Peoples. In light of this, the ministry is proposing additional requirements 
for engagement and consultation with Indigenous communities to take into account 
Indigenous peoples' views of risk assessment and remediation plans.

Outcome 2: Incorporate climate change adaptation in the contaminated sites 
framework.  The ministry has proposed that anticipated and/or predicted changes in site 
conditions under British Columbia's changing climate could be explicitly considered as 
part of all contaminated site investigations and remediation alternatives evaluation. 
Where long-term remediation is proposed for a site, adaptation measures could be re-
evaluated on an ongoing basis as part of risk management to ensure long-term 
protection of human health and environment.

Outcome 3: Incorporate remediation alternatives evaluation more fully in the 
contaminated sites framework. The ministry is proposing to incorporate explicit 
requirements for the evaluation of remediation alternatives for contaminated sites. 
Anyone conducting remediation in British Columbia may need to assess the vulnerability
of potential remediation plans to climate change. Also, the discussion paper 
contemplates requirements to consider intergenerational equity and the feasibility and 
use of green and sustainable remediation methods as part of the evaluation of 
remediation alternatives for contaminated sites.

Outcome 4: Incorporate periodic review of remedial actions for sites with risk 
assessment or risk management approaches. The ministry is considering whether to 
require regular review of sites using risk assessment or management as a remediation 
approach (e.g., every 5 years) and following extreme climate events (e.g., flooding, 
wildfires, etc.). The periodic review would consider potential changes in site 
contamination and vulnerability of the site’s risk management strategy due to climate 
change.

Outcome 5: Establish remediation requirements for viable groundwater aquifers. The
ministry may require the physical remediation of viable drinking water aquifers where 
practicable. Currently, when an aquifer is classified as viable to support current or future
drinking water use, site investigations must be completed to confirm if contamination is 
present, but there is no requirement to physically remediate the aquifer to meet the 
drinking water standards. A requirement of physical remediation of aquifers would be a 
significant change, as the present framework allows remediation to be based on risk 
assessment and institutional controls to prevent the use of aquifers for drinking water 
purposes.

Outcome 6: Incorporate financial security for sites with risk assessment or risk 
management provisions.  In addition to the discussion paper, the ministry is pursuing 
the Public Interest Bonding Strategy, which aims to ensure that owners of industrial 
projects provide sufficient financial assurance to cover the full costs of environmental 
cleanup and reclamation. The discussion paper builds on this, proposing to incorporate 
uncertainty from climate change into financial security requirements for contaminated 
sites.

https://www.bclaws.gov.bc.ca/civix/document/id/complete/statreg/19044
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Next Steps

Members of the public can comment on the discussion paper by either completing an 
online questionnaire or emailing a written submission to site@gov.bc.ca. The deadline 
for submission is 4 p.m. (PST) on Nov. 30, 2022.

For further information, including assistance with your submission, please contact the 
authors listed below or any member of BLG's Environmental team.
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